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By David Peel
Publisher and Editor
Washington Healthcare News

Fourteen Washington State 
domestic health plans recently 
reported YTD second quarter 2012 
financial reports and the results were 
disappointing when compared to 
the same time period in 2011. Eight 
plans reported a lower underwriting 
gain (or greater loss) and twelve 
plans reported lower net income (or 
a greater loss) than the same time 
period in 2011.  

Our report, shown on page 
three, shows total revenues, net 
underwriting gain (loss), investment 

gain (loss), other income and net 
income (loss) for the fourteen 
domestic health plans for the six 
months ended June 30, 2012 and 
June 30, 2011.  We also present 
member months, the combined 
total of month ending membership 
for each six month period.  When 
the financial figures are divided by 
member months, a monthly average 
(per member per month or PMPM) 
over the period is obtained that is 
valuable in comparing one plan to 
another.  Financial statement users 
can then make apples to apples 
comparisons of health plans.

All information in this report was 
obtained through publicly available 
reports filed with the Washington 
State Office of Insurance 
Commissioner (OIC). Information 
not required to be filed with the OIC 
(self-insured and some Washington 
insured business from smaller, non-
domestic carriers) is not included in 
this report nor is it referenced in this 
article.

Comments from Industry 
Representatives

We asked representatives of the 
plans to provide insight into their 

financial results.  Some plans chose 
not to reply to our request.  However, 
others provided valuable comments 
and these follow, sorted by plan size 
in descending order.

Premera Blue Cross & LifeWise 
HealthPlan of Washington

Strong financial results continued 
for Premera Blue Cross although 
there were decreases in net 
underwriting gain, investment gain 
and net income. 

LifeWise HealthPlan of Washington, 
a Premera affiliate,  reported a $4 
million loss. Spokesperson Eric 
Earling explained, “LifeWise is 
losing money because even as our 
membership has grown, it has also 
become sicker and less healthy. In 
addition, a large number of new 
members are bypassing the state’s 
standard health questionnaire when 
applying for coverage. When the 
State established the questionnaire 
over a decade ago, it expected about 
8% of applicants would be screened 
into the state high risk pool. Instead, 
about 40% of our applicants today 
are bypassing the questionnaire 
because of a growing number 
of federal and state exemptions. 



-2-

Those applicants who skip the 
questionnaire have substantially 
higher medical costs because they 
use the healthcare system more.  
For example, those members 
bypassing the questionnaire have 
40% more hospital admissions and 
twice the number of prescriptions 
as our members who took the 
questionnaire when applying for 
coverage. Lastly, LifeWise’s losses 
are larger because the Office of 
Insurance Commissioner has 
approved rates lower than what 
we requested for 2011 and 2012 to 
cover the cost of providing coverage 
to our members.”

Regence BlueShield & Asuris NW 
Health

Regence BlueShield reported 
postive net income through the 2nd 
quarter 2012, although less than the 
same period in 2011.  The Asuris 

NW Health net income figure was 
much higher than the same period 
in 2011. Member months decreased 
for both Regence entities. 

Regence Spokesperson Rachelle 
Cunningham explaned,  “Asuris and 
Regence BlueShield in Washington 
have been focused on balancing 
product portfolios and managing 
risk in underperforming lines 
of business. As a result, overall 
membership has decreased in our 
commercial products, as well as 
in Medicaid, which we exited; 
though we are focusing on growth 
in targeted segments. This strategy 
also has resulted in higher margin 
for the Asuris plan.”

Group Health Cooperative & Group 
Health Options

We asked Group Health 
representatives to comment on their  

overall disappointing financial 
results but did not receive a reply.

Concluding Comments

As mentioned in our report on first 
quarter 2012 plan finanical results, 
this type of across the board decline 
in financial results would historically 
be considered a normal dip in the 
underwriting cycle. However, 
since healthcare reform is in full 
swing it must also be considered a 
factor.  In addition,  plan financial 
results are not showing this level of 
disintegration in other West Coast 
States so it’s likely that Office 
of Insurance Commissioner  rate 
regulation decisions are hurting 
plan financial results.

David Peel is the Publisher of the 
Washington Healthcare News.  He 
can be reached at 425-577-1334 or 
dpeel@healthcarenewssite.com. 

Reprinted with permission from the Washington Healthcare News.  To learn more about the Washington 
Healthcare News visit wahcnews.com.
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